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UNDERGRADUATE COURSE
OFFERINGS
Course Numbering
USC Upstate courses numbered from 001 to 599 may be taken for
undergraduate credit. The following distinctions are made among course
numbers:

• 101-299 Lower division courses primarily for students with freshman
and sophomore standing.

• 300-499 Upper division courses primarily for students with junior and
senior standing.

• 400-599 Upper division courses primarily for students with senior
standing.

With consent of the advisor, a student may take courses numbered
above or below the level normally taken by their academic classification
(freshman, sophomore, junior or senior).

Course Credit
The credit value of each course is usually determined by the number of
class meetings per week for one semester. Two or three laboratory hours
(one period) are equivalent to one class meeting. The semester hour
credit for each course is included in each course description.

Prerequisites
Students may be removed from any class for which prerequisites or other
defined requirements have not been met.

Distance Learning
Individual courses may be offered by distance learning. Please check the
semester schedule for listings.

Course Descriptions
Descriptions of all courses offered for undergraduate credit are arranged
alphabetically by academic discipline on the following pages. Not all
courses are available every term. A schedule of classes is available
before the registration period for each term as an announcement of
course offerings. Students are advised to consult these schedules prior
to registration. The University reserves the right to withdraw any course
on the grounds of insufficient enrollment.

A
• ACCT - Accounting (ACCT) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/acct/)
• AFAM - African Amer Studies (AFAM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/afam/)
• AMEC - Advanced Mechatronics (AMEC) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/amec/)
• AMMG - Adv Manufacturing Mgmt (AMMG) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/ammg/)
• AMST - American Studies (AMST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/amst/)
• ANTH - Anthropology (ANTH) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/anth/)

• ARTE - Art Education (ARTE) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/arte/)

• ARTH - Art History (ARTH) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/arth/)

• ARTS - Art Studio (ARTS) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
undergraduate-course-offerings/arts/)

• ASLG - American Sign Language (ASLG) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/aslg/)

• ASTR - Astronomy (ASTR) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
undergraduate-course-offerings/astr/)

B
• BADM - Business Administration (BADM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/badm/)
• BIOL - Biology (BIOL) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/biol/)

C
• CAST - Child Advocacy Studies (CAST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/cast/)
• CHEM - Chemistry (CHEM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/chem/)
• CHIN - Chinese (CHIN) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/chin/)
• CHME - Community Health Edu (CHME) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/chme/)
• COMM - Communications (COMM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/comm/)
• Course Acronyms (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/course-acronyms/)
• CRJU - Criminal Justice (CRJU) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/crju/)
• CSCI - Computer Science (CSCI) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/csci/)

D
• DGST - Digital Studies (DGST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/dgst/)

E
• ECON - Economics (ECON) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/econ/)
• EDCF - Child Dev & Family Stds (EDCF) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edcf/)
• EDCI - Curriculum, Instruction (EDCI) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edci/)
• EDEC - Early Childhood Educ (EDEC) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edec/)
• EDEL - Elementary Education (EDEL) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edel/)
• EDFO - Educ - Foundations (EDFO) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edfo/)
• EDHL - Health Education (EDHL) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edhl/)
• EDLD - Learning Disabilities (EDLD) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edld/)
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2  Undergraduate Course Offerings

• EDMU - Music Education (EDMU) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edmu/)

• EDPH - Physical Education (EDPH) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edph/)

• EDRE - Reading Education (EDRE) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edre/)

• EDSC - Secondary Education (EDSC) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edsc/)

• EDTC - Educ and Technology (EDTC) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edtc/)

• ENCP - Engr and Computing (ENCP) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/encp/)

• ENGL - English (ENGL) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
undergraduate-course-offerings/engl/)

• ENSL - Engl as a Sec Language (ENSL) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/ensl/)

• ENTR - Entrepreneurship (ENTR) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/entr/)

• ETMG - Engineering Tech Mgmt (ETMG) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/etmg/)

• EXSC - Exercise Science (EXSC) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/exsc/)

F
• FILM - Film Studies (FILM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/film/)
• FINA - Finance (FINA) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/fina/)
• FREN - French (FREN) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/fren/)

G
• GEOG - Geography (GEOG) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geog/)
• GEOL - Geology (GEOL) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/geol/)
• GERM - German (GERM) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/germ/)
• GLST - Global Studies (GLST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/glst/)

H
• HIMS - Health Care Info Mgmt (HIMS) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hims/)
• HIST - History (HIST) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/hist/)
• Home (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/)
• HONS - Honors (HONS) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/hons/)

I
• IDST - Interdisciplinary Studies (IDST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/idst/)
• INFO - Info Mgmt Systems (INFO) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/info/)

• INTL - Intl Study Abroad (INTL) (https://academic-
catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/intl/)

J
• JOUR - Journalism (JOUR) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/jour/)

L
• LIBR - Libraries (LIBR) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/libr/)
• LOGC - Logic (LOGC) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/logc/)
• LSCM - Lgstcs Supply Chn Mgmt (LSCM) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/lscm/)

M
• MATH - Mathematics (MATH) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/math/)
• MGMT - Management (MGMT) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mgmt/)
• MILS - Military Science (MILS) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mils/)
• MKTG - Marketing (MKTG) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mktg/)
• MUSC - Music (MUSC) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/musc/)

N
• NPAD - Non-profit Admin (NPAD) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/npad/)
• NURS - Nursing (NURS) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/nurs/)

P
• PHIL - Philosophy (PHIL) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/phil/)
• PHYS - Physics (PHYS) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/phys/)
• PLAW - Pre-Law (PLAW) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/plaw/)
• POLI - Political Science (POLI) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/poli/)
• PSYC - Psychology (PSYC) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/psyc/)

R
• RELG - Religious Studies (RELG) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/relg/)

S
• SOCY - Sociology (SOCY) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/socy/)
• SOST - Southern Studies (SOST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/sost/)
• SPAN - Spanish (SPAN) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/span/)

https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edmu/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edmu/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edmu/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edph/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edph/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edph/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edre/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edre/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edre/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edtc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edtc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/edtc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/encp/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/encp/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/encp/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/engl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/engl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/engl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/ensl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/ensl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/ensl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/entr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/entr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/entr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/etmg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/etmg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/etmg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/exsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/exsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/exsc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/film/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/film/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/film/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fina/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fina/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fina/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fren/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fren/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/fren/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geog/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geog/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geog/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geol/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geol/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/geol/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/germ/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/germ/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/germ/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/glst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/glst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/glst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hims/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hims/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hims/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hist/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hist/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hist/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hons/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hons/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/hons/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/idst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/idst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/idst/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/info/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/info/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/info/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/intl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/intl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/intl/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/jour/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/jour/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/jour/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/libr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/libr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/libr/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/logc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/logc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/logc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/lscm/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/lscm/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/lscm/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/math/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/math/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/math/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mgmt/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mgmt/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mgmt/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mils/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mils/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mils/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mktg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mktg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/mktg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/musc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/musc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/musc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/npad/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/npad/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/npad/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/nurs/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/nurs/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/nurs/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phil/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phil/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phil/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phys/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phys/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/phys/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/plaw/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/plaw/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/plaw/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/poli/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/poli/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/poli/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/psyc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/psyc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/psyc/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/relg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/relg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/relg/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/socy/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/socy/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/socy/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/sost/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/sost/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/sost/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/span/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/span/
https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/span/


Undergraduate Course Offerings 3

• SPCH - Speech (SPCH) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
undergraduate-course-offerings/spch/)

• STAT - Statistics (STAT) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/
undergraduate-course-offerings/stat/)

T
• THEA - Theatre (THEA) (https://academic-catalog.uscupstate.edu/

undergraduate-course-offerings/thea/)

U
• UNIV - University Experience (UNIV) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/univ/)

W
• WGST - Women & Gender Studies (WGST) (https://academic-

catalog.uscupstate.edu/undergraduate-course-offerings/wgst/)
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